Garland Independent School
GISD Sourcing Bid Tab Report

Bid#: 31584 Title: 293-16 Medical Testing &
Evaluation Services
Ouote# Vendor / Supplier EPCNT Discount
471132 CHEM CHEK CO INC Yes Collection/Testina fees f
471130 FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE No  30%
471131 OCCUMED Yes N/A
470115 OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH CENTERS OF No Not annlicahle: Concentra
471129 PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA CARENOW Yes N/A
Line Awar Extended
# Item Description d(y/ Reason UuoMm Supplier Qty Price Price
1 |Pre-Employment Testing
ob Place e A e e 0
0 Ra A o) D 0 $40.00 $6,000.00
o PATIONA A
RS O PA DBA
A o) RA DICA R 0 45.00 6,750.00
PRIMAR A DBA
A ARENO 0 0.00 $9,000.00
R A A AR
A ASSOCIA P.A 0 $100.00 $15,000.00
o PATIONA A
ob Placement Assesme RSO PA DBA
02 Ray of the b A o) RA DICA R 00 $45.00 $9,000.00
PRIMAR A DBA
A ARENO 00 $105.00 $21,000.00
R A A AR
A ASSOCIA P.A 00 00 000.00




—

Respiration Certification Exam

2.02 Pulmonary Function Test

2.03 Tuberculosis Test

OCCUMED $125.00

FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A.

OCCUMED

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA
CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS

OCCUMED

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH

CENTERS OF SWPA DBA
CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS

FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A.

OCCUMED

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW

$25,000.00

Pulmonary Function Test -_-_---

!




FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A. $40.00

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH

CENTERS OF SWPA DBA
CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS 1

Yes EA

3.01 Instant Urine Drug Screen EA CHEM CHEK CO INC

OCCUMED

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA
CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS

FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A. $10,000.00

CARENOW $12,000.00

3.02 DOT Urine Drug Screen OCCUMED $19,750.00

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA

CHEM CHEK CO INC $20,000.00




FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A. $40.00 $20,000.00

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA
CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS $48.00 $24,000.00

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW $60.00 $30,000.00

FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
3.03 |Breath Alcohol Test (BAT) ASSOCIATES P.A.

CHEM CHEK CO INC

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW

OCCUMED

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA
CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS

3.04 Non-DOT Urine Drug Screen EA OCCUMED

CHEM CHEK CO INC

FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A.

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA
CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW

Medical Review Officer (If separate
3.05 |charge) No Bid OCCUMED

MRO fee is MRO fee is
OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH included with included with
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA the drug the drug
CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS screen price  screen price




FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A.

SEPARATE
CHARGE

SEPARATE
CHARGE

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA

NB No Bid EA CARENOW $1.00 $1.00
NB No Bid EA |CHEM CHEK CO INC $1.00 $1.00
Department of Transportation
Physicals
DOT A a al evaluatio A o) D 0.00 00.00
o PATIONA A
RS O PA DBA
A o) RA DICA 00 850.00
A ASSOCIA P.A 00 6,250.00
PRIMAR A DBA
A ARENO 00 6,250.00
DO emplo e p
evaluatio A o) D 0.00 00.00
o PATIONA A
RS O PA DBA
A o) RA DICA 00 650.00
PRIMAR A DBA
A ARENO $75.00 3 0.00
i\ ASSOCIA P.A $95.00 $14,250.00




4.0 al evaluatio e A O D 0 $60.00 $600.00

PRIMAR A DBA
A AR O 0 00 0.00

O PATIONA A
RS O PA DBA

A O RA DICA R 0 $80.00 $800.00

R A A =
A A OCIA P.A 0 $95.00 950.00

5 |Asbestos Examination

PRIMAR A DBA
0 Asbesto 0 a A AR O 4 00 4.00
o PATIONA A
RS O PA DBA
A o) RA DICA R 4 $196.00 $784.00
A o) D 4 00 900.00
Asbestos Examination wihout X- PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
5.02 |Ray NB No Bid EA CARENOW 4 $1.00 $1.00
o PATIONA A
RS O PA DBA
A o RA DICA R 4 98.00 92.00
A o) D 4 $160.00 $640.00
(Exams/Test/Vaccines/Evaluations
6 |)
OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
Bloodborne Pathogen Exposure, CENTERS OF SWPA DBA
6.01 |Lab NB No Bid EA CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS 1 $0.00 $0.00

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
EA |CARENOW 1 $1.00 $1.00

FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A. $100.00

OCCUMED $120.00

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
Boodborne Pathogen Exposure, CENTERS OF SWPA DBA
6.02 |Counseling NB No Bid CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS $0.00 $0.00




6.04 Hepatitis A Vaccine

6.05 Hepatitis B Vaccine

6.06 Tetanus Vaccine

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW

OCCUMED

FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A.

OCCUMED

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA
CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS

FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A.

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW

FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A.

OCCUMED

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA
CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS

FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A.

OCCUMED

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA
CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW

FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A.

OCCUMED

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA
CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS

$100.00

$40.00

$40.00




6.07 Influenza (flu) Vaccine

6.08 Adult Physical

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW

OCCUMED

FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A.

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA
CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS

OCCUMED

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA
CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS

FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A.

6.09 |Psychological Evaluation NB No Bid EA |OCCUMED NB NB
OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA

NB No Bid EA CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS $0.00 $0.00

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW

FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A.

6.10 |Neurological Evaluation NB No Bid EA OCCUMED NB NB
OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA

NB No Bid EA CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS $0.00 $0.00

Doctor Consultation with

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW

FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A.

6.11 [Specialist NB No Bid EA |OCCUMED NB NB
OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA

NB No Bid EA CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS $0.00 $0.00

Special Education
7 |(Testing/Labs/Counseling)

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW

FIRST FAMILY HEALTHCARE
ASSOCIATES P.A.




PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA

7 Low Vision Exam OCCUMED
CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS

Otological Evaluation No Bid OCCUMED

CARENOW

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA
CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA

7.03 |Pediatric Physicals OCCUMED

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH
CENTERS OF SWPA DBA
CONCENTRA MEDICAL CENTERS

PRIMARY HEALTH INC DBA
CARENOW




