
Bid Tabulation Garland Independent School District

Company Name
(4 hrs)  Half Day 

Costs & Fees 

(8 hrs)   Full Day 

Costs & Fees Per Hour Travel Included Discount

Scholastic Inc. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Benchmark Education Company $2,500.00 yes 0%

Teacher Created Materials $5,000.00 yes 0%

Learning Wheels, Inc. n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

Father Flanagan's Boys' Home n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

National Math and Science Initiative n/a n/a n/a n/a 0%

Kaplan Elementary n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

Loving Guidance, Inc.*Confidential*

American Reading Company n/a $2,600.00 n/a n/a 0%

El Saber Enterprises, Inc. $1,100.00 $2,100.00 n/a yes 0%

El Mundo de los Ninos Publishing Group $4,000.00 $6,500.00 $1,500.00 yes 10%

Glad2teach USA Inc. $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $625.00 no 0%

Kilgo Consulting, Inc. n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

IRIS Educational Media n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

Teaching Systems, Inc. $340.00 $680.00 $85.00 no 0%

Hantis USA, LLC $400.00 $800.00 $100.00 yes 0%

Active Learning Systems, LLC $1,750.00 $3,500.00 n/a yes 5%

Outreach Youth Empowerment, LLC $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $250.00 no 0%

Bill Snow $1,200.00 $2,250.00 no-$55 0%

Junction of Function, Inc. $800.00 $200.00 no 25%

Carnegie Learning, Inc.*Confidential*

Coaching For Results, Inc.

$1000pp/max-12 

participants

$1500pp/mim 2 

instructors

no- mileage federal 

rate, mealsl/w 

receipts 8%

National Reading Styles Institute n/a

$2750-6 hrs up to 30 

participants: $25 

materials fee for each 

additional participant n/a

no-actual

0

Kim Holcomb Educational Consulting, LLC $1,000.00 $2,000.00 n/a

$78.53//139.14 

miles per round trip

Sarah Jandrucko Educational Consulting $375.00 $750.00

hotel/mileage-

district rate n/a

Moncrief 1 Team $4,500.00 $6,000.00 $1,125.00 yes 10%

ETA hand2mind n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

Houghton Mifflin Harcourt Publishing Company n/a $5,600.00 n/a yes 0%

NCS Pearson, Inc. n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

The district solicited 547 suppliers and received 29 responses
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