réé‘yrléh'dmlhdép ndent
ourcing Bid Tab

Bid#: 31464 Title: 155-07-15 Baseball Uniforms
Quote# Vendor / Supplier EPCNT Discount
464791 AMERICA TEAM SPORTS Yes 10-40%. see attached Cata
464790 BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS YES 0%
464782 BSN SPORTS YES 10% *SEE EXCEPTION LIST A
463773 KIMMEL ATHLETIC SUPPLY DBA RB YES 0%
463767 S AND S WORLDWIDE INC Yes 18%
Line Award
# ltem Description (Y/N) Reason
DIAMOND - District Standard
1 Balls, No substitution
1.1 |Diamond D-1 Pro Baseballs Yes
Diamond #DBP Practice
1.2 |Baseballs Yes
1.3 |Diamond Practice Balls #DOL-A Yes
Diamond DBP Practice Ball
1.4 |Buckets Yes
Yes
1.1 |Diamond D-1 Pro Baseballs No
Diamond #DBP Practice
1.2 |Baseballs No
1.3 |Diamond Practice Balls #DOL-A No
Diamond DBP Practice Ball
1.4 |Buckets No
No
1.1 |[Diamond D-1 Pro Baseballs No
Diamond #DBP Practice
1.2 ([Baseballs No
1.3 |Diamond Practice Balls #DOL-A No




Diamond DBP Practice Ball

1.4 |Buckets No
No
1.1 |Diamond D-1 Pro Baseballs No
Diamond #DBP Practice
1.2 |Baseballs No
1.3 |Diamond Practice Balls #DOL-A No
Diamond DBP Practice Ball
1.4 |Buckets No
No
1.1 |Diamond D-1 Pro Baseballs No
Diamond #DBP Practice
1.2 |Baseballs No
1.3 |Diamond Practice Balls #DOL-A No
Diamond DBP Practice Ball
1.4 |Buckets No
No
2 |JUGS
2.1 [Jugs Lite Flight Balls No
Jugs Yellow Dimpled Pitching
2.2 |Machine Balls No
No
2.1 |Jugs Lite Flight Balls No
Jugs Yellow Dimpled Pitching
2.2 |Machine Balls No
No
2.1 [Jugs Lite Flight Balls Yes
Jugs Yellow Dimpled Pitching
2.2 |Machine Balls Yes
Yes
2.1 |Jugs Lite Flight Balls No




Jugs Yellow Dimpled Pitching
2.2 |Machine Balls No
No
3 |[TWIN CITY
Twin City Socks, OSK 36 black
Garland, 60 maroon, 36 navy
3.1 [Rowlett, 36 red South Garland Yes
Yes
Twin City Socks, OSK 36 black
Garland, 60 maroon, 36 navy
3.1 |Rowlett, 36 red South Garland No
No
Twin City Socks, OSK 36 black
Garland, 60 maroon, 36 navy
3.1 |Rowlett, 36 red South Garland No
No
Twin City Socks, OSK 36 black
Garland, 60 maroon, 36 navy
3.1 |Rowlett, 36 red South Garland No
No
4 |RUSSELL
Rusell Nublend T-shirts
#64030MK Black with red "NG"
"Baseball" Sizes to follow when
4.01 |order is placed No
Russell Men's Mesh Pocket
Short #651 AFMO-black with red
"NG" "Baseball" on left leg,
Sizes to follow when order is
4.02 |placed No
No
Rusell Nublend T-shirts
#64030MK Black with red "NG"
"Baseball" Sizes to follow when
4.01 |order is placed No




Russell Men's Mesh Pocket
Short #651 AFMO-black with red
"NG" "Baseball" on left leg,
Sizes to follow when order is

4.02 |placed No
No
Rusell Nublend T-shirts
#64030MK Black with red "NG"
"Baseball" Sizes to follow when
4.01 |order is placed No
Russell Men's Mesh Pocket
Short #651 AFMO-black with red
"NG" "Baseball" on left leg,
Sizes to follow when order is
4.02 |placed No
No
Rusell Nublend T-shirts
#64030MK Black with red "NG"
"Baseball" Sizes to follow when
4.01 |order is placed Yes
Russell Men's Mesh Pocket
Short #651 AFMO-black with red
"NG" "Baseball" on left leg,
Sizes to follow when order is
4.02 |placed Yes
Yes
5 |ALL-STAR
5.01 |All-Star Shin Guards, navy No
5.02 |All-Star Chest Protector, navy No
No
5.01 [All-Star Shin Guards, navy No
5.02 [All-Star Chest Protector, navy No
No
5.01 [All-Star Shin Guards, navy Yes




5.02

All-Star Chest Protector, navy

RAWLINGS

Yes
Yes

6.01

Rawlings Baseball Uniform
Jersey #CSUCPJ ¢, white with
black/gold trim Two color
lettering & numbers Sizes to
follow when order is placed
Garland

Yes

6.02

Rawlings Baseball Pants
#BPVP White with black/gold
trim Sizes to follow when order
Is placed Garland

Yes

6.03

Rawlings Catcher¢s Mitt 32¢, ¢
black South Garland

Yes

6.04

Rawlings #TRIO Bat 32¢, ¢ 29
0z. South Garland

Yes

6.05

Rawling Baseball Pants White
with 3/8" bead- maroon, 10
medium, 10 large

Yes

6.06

Rawlings 34" Catcher Baseball
Glove

Yes

6.07

Rawlings Adult Long Sleeve
Shirt, maroon, 40 medium, 15
large, 5 x-large

Yes

6.08

Rawlings Adult Long Sleeve
Shirt, navy, 20 medium, 7 large,
3 x-large

Yes

6.09

6.01

Rawlings 90 MPH Batting
Helmet, Navy 2 small, 4
medium, 2 large

Rawlings Baseball Uniform
Jersey #CSUCPJ ¢ white with
black/gold trim Two color
lettering & numbers Sizes to
follow when order is placed
Garland

Yes
Yes

No




Rawlings Baseball Pants
#BPVP White with black/gold
trim Sizes to follow when order

6.02 [is placed Garland No
Rawlings Catcher¢s Mitt 32¢, ¢

6.03 |black South Garland No
Rawlings #TRIO Bat 32¢, ¢, 29

6.04 |oz. South Garland No
Rawling Baseball Pants White
with 3/8" bead- maroon, 10

6.05 |medium, 10 large No
Rawlings 34" Catcher Baseball

6.06 |Glove No
Rawlings Adult Long Sleeve
Shirt, maroon, 40 medium, 15

6.07 [large, 5 x-large No
Rawlings Adult Long Sleeve
Shirt, navy, 20 medium, 7 large,

6.08 |3 x-large No
Rawlings 90 MPH Batting
Helmet, Navy 2 small, 4

6.09 |medium, 2 large No

No

Rawlings Baseball Uniform
Jersey #CSUCPJ ¢ white with
black/gold trim Two color
lettering & numbers Sizes to
follow when order is placed

6.01 |Garland No
Rawlings Baseball Pants
#BPVP White with black/gold
trim Sizes to follow when order

6.02 [is placed Garland No
Rawlings Catcher¢s Mitt 32¢, ¢,

6.03 [black South Garland No
Rawlings #TRIO Bat 32¢, ¢, 29

6.04 |oz. South Garland No
Rawling Baseball Pants White
with 3/8" bead- maroon, 10

6.05 |medium, 10 large No




6.06

Rawlings 34" Catcher Baseball
Glove

No

6.07

Rawlings Adult Long Sleeve
Shirt, maroon, 40 medium, 15
large, 5 x-large

No

6.08

Rawlings Adult Long Sleeve
Shirt, navy, 20 medium, 7 large,
3 x-large

No

6.09

Rawlings 90 MPH Batting
Helmet, Navy 2 small, 4
medium, 2 large

No

No

NIKE

7.01

Nike Team Tech Fleece Hoody
#98437657 Red with 6¢,
interlocking ¢SG¢ in white on
chest. Sizes to follow when
order is placed.

No

7.02

Nike Shield Therma- Fit Crew
Shirt #632184,
anthracite/black/white, X-Large

No

7.03

Nike Cage Short Sleeve Jacket
#19853230, Black/Grey, sizes to
follow when order is placed.

No

7.04

Nike Adult Light Out Il Baseball
Pant #578534, grey, 10 small, 10
medium, 6 large, 4 x-large

No

7.05

Nike Long Ball Game Pants
#578534 Blue Grey/Black, 4
medium, 3 Large, 1 x- large

No

7.06

Nike Long Ball Game Pants
#578535, White/Royal, 4
medium, 3 large, 1 x-large

No

7.07

Nike Men's 3 Pocket Short
#418635, Black/Matt Silver, x-
large

No




7.08

Nike Compression Tight 2.0
#449822, 1 x-large Black/Cool
Grey, 1 x-large White/Cool Grey

No

No

7.01

Nike Team Tech Fleece Hoody
#98437657 Red with 6¢,
interlocking ¢SGg¢, in white on
chest. Sizes to follow when
order is placed.

Yes

7.02

Nike Shield Therma- Fit Crew
Shirt #632184,
anthracite/black/white, X-Large

Yes

7.03

Nike Cage Short Sleeve Jacket
#19853230, Black/Grey, sizes to
follow when order is placed.

Yes

7.04

Nike Adult Light Out Il Baseball
Pant #578534, grey, 10 small, 10
medium, 6 large, 4 x-large

Yes

7.05

Nike Long Ball Game Pants
#578534 Blue Grey/Black, 4
medium, 3 Large, 1 x- large

Yes

7.06

Nike Long Ball Game Pants
#578535, White/Royal, 4
medium, 3 large, 1 x-large

Yes

7.07

Nike Men's 3 Pocket Short
#418635, Black/Matt Silver, x-
large

Yes

7.08

Nike Compression Tight 2.0
#449822, 1 x-large Black/Cool
Grey, 1 x-large White/Cool Grey

Easton

Yes
Yes

8.01

Easton Senior Natural Grip
White Batting Helmets
#A168022 WHT, Sizes to follow
when order is placed

Yes




Easton Mako Custom Adult

8.02 |Catchers Gear #16525249, red Yes
Easton Solid Color Batting
Helmet, #Z5 Grip, navy, sizes to

8.03 |follow when order is placed. Yes
Easton Bat S1, 33"- 30 oz.

8.04 [(#BB15S1 Yes
Easton M7 Catchers Helmet

8.05 |#M7CP red, large Yes
Easton M7 Chest Protector

8.06 |#A165309 red, large Yes
Easton M7 Shin Guards

8.07 [#A165309, 16.5"- red Yes

Yes

Easton Senior Natural Grip
White Batting Helmets
#A168022 WHT, Sizes to follow

8.01 |when order is placed No
Easton Mako Custom Adult

8.02 |Catchers Gear #16525249, red No
Easton Solid Color Batting
Helmet, #Z5 Grip, navy, sizes to

8.03 |follow when order is placed. No
Easton Bat S1, 33"- 30 oz.

8.04 (#BB15S1 No
Easton M7 Catchers Helmet

8.05 |#M7CP red, large No
Easton M7 Chest Protector

8.06 [#A165309 red, large No
Easton M7 Shin Guards

8.07 [#A165309, 16.5"- red No

No

Easton Senior Natural Grip
White Batting Helmets
#A168022 WHT, Sizes to follow

8.01 [when order is placed No




Easton Mako Custom Adult

8.02 |Catchers Gear #16525249, red No
Easton Solid Color Batting
Helmet, #Z5 Grip, navy, sizes to
8.03 |follow when order is placed. No
Easton Bat S1, 33"- 30 oz.
8.04 [(#BB15S1 No
Easton M7 Catchers Helmet
8.05 |#M7CP red, large No
Easton M7 Chest Protector
8.06 |#A165309 red, large No
Easton M7 Shin Guards
8.07 [#A165309, 16.5"- red No
No
9 |SKLz
SKLZ Overload/Underload
9.01 |Training Yes
9.02 [SKLZ Power-Thru Balls (3 pack) Yes
SKLZ Weighted Baseballs (2
9.03 |pack) Yes
9.04 |SKLZ Balanz Board #APDBBO01 Yes
Yes
SKLZ Overload/Underload
9.01 (Training No
9.02 [SKLZ Power-Thru Balls (3 pack) No
SKLZ Weighted Baseballs (2
9.03 [pack) No
9.04 [SKLZ Balanz Board #APDBBO01 No
No
SKLZ Overload/Underload
9.01 [Training No
9.02 [SKLZ Power-Thru Balls (3 pack) No




9.03

SKLZ Weighted Baseballs (2
pack)

No

9.04

SKLZ Balanz Board #APDBBO01

No

No

10

MISCELLANEOUS

10.01

Adams Belts #26, 3 dozen black
and 2 dozen red

Yes

10.02

A4 #N3230 Fusion Short Sleeve,
crew neck, black with two color
lettering logo & sizes to follow
when order is placed.

Yes

10.03

A4 #N3230 Fusion Short Sleeve,
Crew neck, royal blue with 6"
interlocking "SG", white
outlined in red

Yes

10.04

A4 #N3221 Fusion Long Sleeve,
red with 6" interlocking "SG"
white outlined in royal, sizes to
follow when order is placed

Yes

10.05

A4 Dri-fit Loose short sleeve,
#N3142 royal with 3"
interlocking "LC" at neck royal
blue outlined in white, 16
medium, 14 large, 8 x-large, 2
xx-large

Yes

10.06

A4 Dri-fit loose long sleeve,
#N3165 Royal with 3"
interlocking "LC" at neck white
outloned in black, 16 medium,
14 large, 8 x-large, 2 xx-large

Yes

10.07

Demarini Pro Mapple
Composite Wood Bat BBCOR
#DXS243- 33"- 33 0z.

Yes

10.08

Demarini Pro Maple Composite
Wood Bat, BBCOR #DX243- 33"-
30 oz.

Yes




Louisville Slugger #OMAHA Bat,

10.09 |33"- 30 oz. Yes
Louisville Slugger #OMAHA Bat,

10.10 |32"-29 oz. Yes
ATEC Yellow Tuffy Single Tee,

10.11 [#PU WTAT7375 Yes

10.12 |Champro Pro Base Set #BB155 Yes
Promounds Collegiate Portable

10.13 [Pitching Yes
Crossover Symmetry Team

10.14 |Hybrid Outdoor Package #CSTP Yes
Richardson Atheltics Batter's

10.15 |Box Mats, 4'x6' TTBB46, green Yes
Richardson Athletics Cocoa

10.16 (Drag Mats Yes
Diamond Turf Homeplate Mat 6'
X 12' clay colored with
permanent insert home plate &

10.17 |white turf lines #TB- K13843 Yes

10.18 |Dig out tool #TB-K10395 Yes

10.19 |Tanner Tee #TB-K11059 Yes
Tomark Baseball Scorebook #T-

10.20 [K12141 Yes
Tomark Baseball Line-up cards

10.21 |#TB-K12140 Yes

10.22 [Rubber Base Plugs #BB-64 Yes
Glover Refill Baseball Score

10.23 |Sheets, 50 sheets #TB-K12965 Yes
Schutt Air 5.6 Batting Helmets
#325650, red matte finish, 3
small, 3 medium, 3 large, 1 x-

10.24 |large Yes
Newliner Chalker #DLMN35-2 25

10.25 |Ibs. capacity, 2 wheeled Yes




10.26

Pukka cap with two color
lettering #SF3

Yes

10.27

Pacific Headwear #8D5 D Series
A/C2, White crown, red bill, red

button & eyelets, full red piping
on crown, red interlocking "SG"
outlined in royal.

Yes

10.28

10.01

2015-2016 Baseball Rule Books

Adams Belts #26, 3 dozen black
and 2 dozen red

Yes
Yes

No

10.02

A4 #N3230 Fusion Short Sleeve,
crew neck, black with two color
lettering logo & sizes to follow
when order is placed.

No

10.03

A4 #N3230 Fusion Short Sleeve,
Crew neck, royal blue with 6"
interlocking "SG", white
outlined in red

No

10.04

A4 #N3221 Fusion Long Sleeve,
red with 6" interlocking "SG"
white outlined in royal, sizes to
follow when order is placed

No

10.05

A4 Dri-fit Loose short sleeve,
#N3142 royal with 3"
interlocking "LC" at neck royal
blue outlined in white, 16
medium, 14 large, 8 x-large, 2
xx-large

No

10.06

A4 Dri-fit loose long sleeve,
#N3165 Royal with 3"
interlocking "LC" at neck white
outloned in black, 16 medium,
14 large, 8 x-large, 2 xx-large

No




Demarini Pro Mapple
Composite Wood Bat BBCOR

10.07 |#DXS243- 33"- 33 oz. No
Demarini Pro Maple Composite
Wood Bat, BBCOR #DX243- 33"-

10.08 |30 oz. No
Louisville Slugger #OMAHA Bat,

10.09 |33"- 30 oz. No
Louisville Slugger #OMAHA Bat,

10.10 |32"-29 oz. No
ATEC Yellow Tuffy Single Tee,

10.11 [#PU WTAT7375 No

10.12 |Champro Pro Base Set #BB155 No
Promounds Collegiate Portable

10.13 |Pitching No
Crossover Symmetry Team

10.14 |Hybrid Outdoor Package #CSTP No
Richardson Atheltics Batter's

10.15 |Box Mats, 4'x6' TTBB46, green No
Richardson Athletics Cocoa

10.16 |Drag Mats No
Diamond Turf Homeplate Mat 6'
x 12' clay colored with
permanent insert home plate &

10.17 |white turf lines #TB- K13843 No

10.18 |Dig out tool #TB-K10395 No

10.19 [Tanner Tee #TB-K11059 No
Tomark Baseball Scorebook #T-

10.20 (K12141 No
Tomark Baseball Line-up cards

10.21 |#TB-K12140 No

10.22 |Rubber Base Plugs #BB-64 No




10.23

Glover Refill Baseball Score
Sheets, 50 sheets #TB-K12965

No

10.24

Schutt Air 5.6 Batting Helmets
#325650, red matte finish, 3
small, 3 medium, 3 large, 1 x-
large

No

10.25

Newliner Chalker #DLMN35-2 25
Ibs. capacity, 2 wheeled

No

10.26

Pukka cap with two color
lettering #SF3

No

10.27

Pacific Headwear #8D5 D Series
A/C2, White crown, red bill, red

button & eyelets, full red piping
on crown, red interlocking "SG"
outlined in royal.

No

10.28

2015-2016 Baseball Rule Books

No

No

10.01

Adams Belts #26, 3 dozen black
and 2 dozen red

No

10.02

A4 #N3230 Fusion Short Sleeve,
crew neck, black with two color
lettering logo & sizes to follow
when order is placed.

No

10.03

A4 #N3230 Fusion Short Sleeve,
Crew neck, royal blue with 6"
interlocking "SG", white
outlined in red

No

10.04

A4 #N3221 Fusion Long Sleeve,
red with 6" interlocking "SG"
white outlined in royal, sizes to
follow when order is placed

No




10.05

A4 Dri-fit Loose short sleeve,
#N3142 royal with 3"
interlocking "LC" at neck royal
blue outlined in white, 16
medium, 14 large, 8 x-large, 2
xx-large

No

10.06

A4 Dri-fit loose long sleeve,
#N3165 Royal with 3"
interlocking "LC" at neck white
outloned in black, 16 medium,
14 large, 8 x-large, 2 xx-large

No

10.07

Demarini Pro Mapple
Composite Wood Bat BBCOR
#DXS243- 33"- 33 0z.

No

10.08

Demarini Pro Maple Composite
Wood Bat, BBCOR #DX243- 33"-
30 oz.

No

10.09

Louisville Slugger #OMAHA Bat,
33"-30o0z.

No

10.10

Louisville Slugger #OMAHA Bat,
32"-29 oz.

No

10.11

ATEC Yellow Tuffy Single Tee,
#PU WTAT7375

No

10.12

Champro Pro Base Set #BB155

No

10.13

Promounds Collegiate Portable
Pitching

No

10.14

Crossover Symmetry Team
Hybrid Outdoor Package #CSTP

No

10.15

Richardson Atheltics Batter's
Box Mats, 4'x6' TTBB46, green

No

10.16

Richardson Athletics Cocoa
Drag Mats

No

10.17

Diamond Turf Homeplate Mat 6'
x 12' clay colored with
permanent insert home plate &
white turf lines #TB- K13843

No




10.18 |Dig out tool #TB-K10395 No
10.19 [Tanner Tee #TB-K11059 No
Tomark Baseball Scorebook #T-

10.20 |K12141 No

Tomark Baseball Line-up cards
10.21 |#TB-K12140 No
10.22 |Rubber Base Plugs #BB-64 No
Glover Refill Baseball Score
10.23 |Sheets, 50 sheets #TB-K12965 No
Schutt Air 5.6 Batting Helmets
#325650, red matte finish, 3
small, 3 medium, 3 large, 1 x-
10.24 |large No
Newliner Chalker #DLMN35-2 25
10.25 |Ibs. capacity, 2 wheeled No
Pukka cap with two color
10.26 |lettering #SF3 No
Pacific Headwear #8D5 D Series
A/C2, White crown, red bill, red
button & eyelets, full red piping
on crown, red interlocking "SG"
10.27 |outlined in royal. No
10.28 |2015-2016 Baseball Rule Books No

No




Extended

UOM Supplier Qty | Price Price
DZ |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 78 $62.00 $4,836.00
DZ |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 18 $37.00 $666.00
DZ |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 47 $42.00 $1,974.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 2 $17.00 $34.00

AMERICA TEAM SPORTS TOTAL $7,510.00
DZ |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS | 78 $68.90 $5,374.20
DZ |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS | 18 $41.90 $754.20
DZ |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS | 47 $45.90 $2,157.30
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 2 $124.00 $248.00

BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS TOTAL $8,533.70
DZ |[BSN SPORTS 78 $70.22 $5,477.16
DZ |BSN SPORTS 18 $40.98 $737.64
DZ |BSN SPORTS 47 $46.43 $2,182.21




EA |BSN SPORTS 2 $0.00 NB
BSN SPORTS TOTAL $8,397.01
KIMMEL ATHLETIC SUPPLY DBA

DZ |RB SPORTING GOODS 78 $61.74 $4,815.72
KIMMEL ATHLETIC SUPPLY DBA

DZ |RB SPORTING GOODS 18 $40.65 $731.70
KIMMEL ATHLETIC SUPPLY DBA

DZ |RB SPORTING GOODS 47 $48.65 $2,286.55
KIMMEL ATHLETIC SUPPLY DBA

EA |RB SPORTING GOODS 2 $14.65 $29.30
KIMMEL ATHLETIC SUPPLY DBA
RB SPORTING GOODS Total $7,863.27

DZ |S AND S WORLDWIDE INC 78 $74.15 $5,783.70

DZ |S AND S WORLDWIDE INC 18 $43.50 $783.00

DZ |S AND S WORLDWIDE INC 47 $50.40 $2,368.80

EA |S AND S WORLDWIDE INC 2 $14.75 $29.50
S AND S WORLDWIDE INC Total $8,965.00

DZ |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $27.00 $27.00

DZ |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $27.00 $27.00
AMERICA TEAM SPORTS TOTAL $54.00

DZ |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 1 $44.95 $44.95

DZ |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 1 $63.00 $63.00
BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS TOTAL $107.95

DZ |BSN SPORTS 1 $18.84 $18.84

DZ |BSN SPORTS 1 $14.58 $14.58
BSN SPORTS TOTAL $33.42
KIMMEL ATHLETIC SUPPLY DBA

DZ |RB SPORTING GOODS 1 $24.10 $24.10




KIMMEL ATHLETIC SUPPLY DBA

DZ |RB SPORTING GOODS 1 $33.05 $33.05
KIMMEL ATHLETIC SUPPLY DBA
RB SPORTING GOODS Total $57.15
PR |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 168 $3.20 $537.60
AMERICA TEAM SPORTS TOTAL $537.60
PR [BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 168 $3.69 $619.92
BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS TOTAL $619.92
PR [BSN SPORTS 168 $4.35 $730.80
BSN SPORTS TOTAL $730.80
KIMMEL ATHLETIC SUPPLY DBA
PR |RB SPORTING GOODS 168 $3.67 $616.56
KIMMEL ATHLETIC SUPPLY DBA
RB SPORTING GOODS Total $616.56
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 40 $5.75 $230.00
PR |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 40 $11.25 $450.00
AMERICA TEAM SPORTS TOTAL $680.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 40 $5.45 $218.00




PR |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 40 $10.98 $439.20
BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS TOTAL $657.20
EA |BSN SPORTS 40 NB NB
PR [BSN SPORTS 40 NB NB
BSN SPORTS TOTAL NB
KIMMEL ATHLETIC SUPPLY DBA
EA |RB SPORTING GOODS 40 $5.30 $212.00
KIMMEL ATHLETIC SUPPLY DBA
PR [RB SPORTING GOODS 40 $9.71 $388.40
KIMMEL ATHLETIC SUPPLY DBA
RB SPORTING GOODS Total $600.40
PR [AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $80.00 $80.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $80.00 $80.00
AMERICA TEAM SPORTS TOTAL $160.00
PR |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 1 $150.00 $150.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 1 $144.00 $144.00
BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS TOTAL $294.00
PR [BSN SPORTS 1 $90.46 $90.46




EA |BSN SPORTS 1 $61.82 $61.82

BSN SPORTS TOTAL $152.28
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 23 $77.00 $1,771.00
PR |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 25 $40.00 $1,000.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $90.00 $90.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $250.00 $250.00
PR |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 20 $43.00 $860.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 2 $197.00 $394.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 60 $12.00 $720.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 30 $12.00 $360.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 8 $57.00 $456.00

AMERICA TEAM SPORTS TOTAL $5,901.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 23 $85.50 $1,966.50




PR |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS | 25 $43.90 $1,097.50
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 1 $102.00 $102.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 1 $360.00 $360.00
PR |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS | 20 $38.45 $769.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 2 $324.00 $648.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS | 60 $12.75 $765.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS | 30 $12.75 $382.50
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 8 $56.95 $455.60

BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS TOTAL $6,546.10
EA |BSN SPORTS 23 NB NB
PR |BSN SPORTS 25 NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS 1 $36.02 $36.02
EA |BSN SPORTS 1 NB NB
PR |BSN SPORTS 20 NB NB




EA |BSN SPORTS 2 $49.16 $98.32
EA |BSN SPORTS 60 NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS 30 NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS 8 NB NB

BSN SPORTS TOTAL $134.34
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 25 $37.50 $937.50
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 4 $48.60 $194.40
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 20 $33.60 $672.00
PR [BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 30 $22.48 $674.40
PR |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 8 $22.48 $179.84
PR [BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 8 $25.45 $203.60
PR |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 4 $21.75 $87.00




PR [BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 2 $19.69 $39.38

BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS TOTAL $2,988.12
EA |BSN SPORTS 25 $30.00 $750.00
EA |BSN SPORTS 4 $47.00 $188.00
EA |BSN SPORTS 20 $32.00 $640.00
PR |BSN SPORTS 30 $22.00 $660.00
PR [BSN SPORTS 8 $25.00 $200.00
PR |BSN SPORTS 8 $25.00 $200.00
PR [BSN SPORTS 4 $21.00 $84.00
PR [BSN SPORTS 2 $17.00 $34.00

BSN SPORTS TOTAL $2,756.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 8 $30.00 $240.00




ST |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS $250.00 $250.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS $30.00 $240.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS $300.00 $300.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS $80.00 $80.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS $50.00 $50.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS $57.00 $57.00

AMERICA TEAM SPORTS TOTAL $1,217.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $45.90 $367.20
ST |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $395.00 $395.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $28.80 $230.40
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $399.00 $399.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $74.00 $74.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $45.00 $45.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $54.89 $54.89

BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS TOTAL $1,565.49
EA |BSN SPORTS NB NB




ST |BSN SPORTS NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS $28.68 $229.44
EA |BSN SPORTS NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS NB NB

BSN SPORTS TOTAL $229.44
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS $55.00 $110.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS $20.00 $120.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS $20.00 $100.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS $47.00 $94.00

AMERICA TEAM SPORTS TOTAL $424.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $69.98 $139.96
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $60.00 $360.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $28.00 $140.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $45.00 $90.00

BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS TOTAL $729.96
EA |BSN SPORTS NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS NB NB




EA |BSN SPORTS 5 NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS 2 NB NB

BSN SPORTS TOTAL NB
DZN |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 5 $35.00 $175.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 40 $7.77 $310.80
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 40 $7.77 $310.80
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 40 $9.00 $360.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 40 $7.77 $310.80
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 40 $9.00 $360.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 2 $120.00 $240.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 2 $120.00 $240.00




EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $150.00 $150.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $150.00 $150.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $115.00 $115.00
ST |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $127.00 $127.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $1,195.00 $1,195.00
PK |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $700.00 $700.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 2 $180.00 $360.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $210.00 $210.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $450.00 $450.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $8.00 $8.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 3 $70.00 $210.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $14.00 $14.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 2 $8.00 $16.00
ST |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $15.00 $15.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $14.00 $14.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 10 $30.00 $300.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 1 $147.00 $147.00




EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 48 $16.50 $792.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 36 $18.00 $648.00
EA |AMERICA TEAM SPORTS 8 $10.75 $86.00

AMERICA TEAM SPORTS TOTAL $8,014.40
DZN |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 5 $45.00 $225.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 40 $8.45 $338.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 40 $8.45 $338.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 40 $9.45 $378.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 40 $9.45 $378.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 40 $8.20 $328.00




EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $130.00 $260.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $130.00 $260.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $210.00 $210.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $210.00 $210.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $132.00 $132.00
ST |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $190.00 $190.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $1,300.00 $1,300.00
PK [BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $750.00 $750.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $450.00 $900.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $250.00 $250.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $524.99 $524.99
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $8.00 $8.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $75.00 $225.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $12.00 $12.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $8.95 $17.90
ST |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS $21.00 $21.00




EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 1 $13.50 $13.50
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 10 $38.95 $389.50
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 1 $170.00 $170.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 48 $17.50 $840.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 36 $17.50 $630.00
EA |BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS 8 $16.00 $128.00

BARCELONA SPORTING GOODS TOTAL $9,426.89
DZN |BSN SPORTS 5 $18.72 $93.60
EA |BSN SPORTS 40 NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS 40 NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS 40 NB NB




EA |BSN SPORTS 40 NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS 40 NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS 2 NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS 2 NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS 1 NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS 1 $180.06 $180.06
EA |BSN SPORTS 1 $128.64 $128.64
ST |BSN SPORTS 1 $101.93 $101.93
EA |BSN SPORTS 1 $968.83 $968.83
PK [BSN SPORTS 1 NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS 2 $159.44 $318.88
EA |BSN SPORTS 1 $132.32 $132.32
EA |BSN SPORTS 1 $318.32 $318.32




EA |BSN SPORTS 1 $2.64 $2.64
EA |BSN SPORTS 3 $72.03 $216.09
EA |BSN SPORTS 1 $2.76 $2.76
EA |BSN SPORTS 2 $5.36 $10.72
ST |BSN SPORTS 1 $2.02 $2.02
EA |BSN SPORTS 1 $12.96 $12.96
EA |BSN SPORTS 10 $21.46 $214.60
EA |BSN SPORTS 1 $94.38 $94.38
EA |BSN SPORTS 48 NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS 36 NB NB
EA |BSN SPORTS 8 $2.76 $22.08

BSN SPORTS Total $2,820.83




Min
Release Note 1st

Manufacturer:Diamond

Manufacturer:Diamond

Manufacturer:Diamond

Bucket Only Manufacturer:Diamond

Manufacturer:DIAMOND

Manufacturer:DIAMOND

Manufacturer:DIAMOND

Manufacturer:DIAMOND

As Spec BSN /Diamond Manufacturer:DIAMOND

AS SPEC BSN Manufacturer:DIAMOND

AS SPEC Manufacturer:DIAMOND




NO BID Manufacturer:NO BID

Manufacturer:DIAMOND

Manufacturer:DIAMOND

Manufacturer:DIAMOND

Manufacturer:DIAMOND

dropship delivery from

O[manufacturer Manufacturer:Diamond
Dropship delivery from

O[manufacturer Manufacturer:Diamond
dropship from

O[manufacturer Manufacturer:Diamond

6 gallon bucket with
padded lid. dropship
O|delivery from manufacturer [Manufacturer:Diamond

Manufacturer:Jugs

Manufacturer:Jugs

Manufacturer:JUGS

Manufacturer:JUGS

As Spec Bsn/Jugs Manufacturer:JUGS

ALT SPEC BSN/Macgregor [Manufacturer:MACGREGOR

Manufacturer:JUGS




Manufacturer:JUGS

Manufacturer: Twin City

Manufacturer:TWIN CITIES

AS SPEC Manufacturer:TWIN CITY

Manufacturer:TWIN CITY

Manufacturer/Brand:A4




Manufacturer/Brand:RUSSEL
L

NO BID

NO BID

Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID

Manufacturer/Brand:RUSSEL
L

Manufacturer:All Star

Manufacturer:All Star

Manufacturer:ALL STAR

Manufacturer:ALL STAR

As Spec bsn/All-Star *16
1/2" navy -pro design

Manufacturer:ALL STAR




As Spec BSN/AII-Star * pro
design Manufacturer:ALL STAR

Manufacturer:Rawlings

Manufacturer:Rawlings

Manufacturer:Rawlings

Manufacturer:Marucci

PRO150 w/ OP4 3/8" Braid

Manufacturer/Brand:Rawlings

Manufacturer/Brand:Rawlings

Manufacturer/Brand:Rawlings

TACKLE TWILL
LETTERING AND
NUMBERS Manufacturer:RAWLINGS




Manufacturer:RAWLINGS

Manufacturer:RAWLINGS

Manufacturer:RAWLINGS

Manufacturer/Brand:RAWLIN
GS

PLAIN
Manufacturer/Brand:RAWLIN

PLAIN GS
Manufacturer/Brand:RAWLIN
GS

NO BID Manufacturer:NO BID

NO BID Manufacturer:NO BID

ALT SPEC

BSN/MACGREGOR Manufacturer:MACGREGOR

V Manufacturer:NO BID




ALT SPEC BSN/Mizuno .

Manufacturer/Brand:MIZUNO

NO BID
NO BID Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID
NO BID Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID

Manufacturer:NIKE

Manufacturer/Brand:NIKE

Manufacturer/Brand:NIKE

Manufacturer/Brand:NIKE

Manufacturer/Brand:NIKE

Manufacturer/Brand:NIKE

Manufacturer/Brand:NIKE




Manufacturer/Brand:NIKE

CODE IS NOT CORRECT Manufacturer:NIKE

AS SPEC BSN/NIKE Manufacturer/Brand:NIKE
Code is not correct Manufacturer/Brand:NIKE
OLD SITE Manufacturer/Brand:NIKE
NIKE Manufacturer/Brand:NIKE
AS SPEC BSN/NIKE Manufacturer/Brand:NIKE
AS SPEC BSN/NIKE Manufacturer/Brand:NIKE
NIKE Manufacturer/Brand:NIKE

Z5 Grip Manufacturer/Brand:Easton




M10 Custom Adult
Catcher's Gear

Manufacturer/Brand:Easton

Manufacturer/Brand:Easton

Manufacturer/Brand:Easton

Manufacturer/Brand:Easton

Manufacturer/Brand:Easton

Manufacturer/Brand:Easton

Manufacturer/Brand:EASTON

Manufacturer/Brand:EASTON

Manufacturer/Brand:EASTON

Manufacturer/Brand:EASTON

Manufacturer/Brand:EASTON

Manufacturer/Brand:EASTON

Manufacturer/Brand:EASTON

NO BID

Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID




NO BID Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID
AS SPEC Manufacturer/Brand:EASTON
NO BID Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID
NO BID Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID
NO BID Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID
NO BID Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID

Must Order in 2-Packs

Manufacturer/Brand:SKLZ

Must Order in 4-Packs

Manufacturer/Brand:SKLZ

Must Order in 4-Packs

Manufacturer/Brand:SKLZ

VersaBalance Board

Manufacturer/Brand:Power
Systems

Manufacturer/Brand:SKLS

Manufacturer/Brand:SKLZ

Manufacturer/Brand:SKLZ

Manufacturer/Brand:SKLZ

NO BID

Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID

NO BID

Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID




NO BID

Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID

NO BID

Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID

Manufacturer/Brand:Adams

Manufacturer/Brand:A4

Manufacturer/Brand:A4

Manufacturer/Brand:A4

Manufacturer/Brand:A4

Manufacturer/Brand:A4

Manufacturer/Brand:Demarini

Manufacturer/Brand:Demarini




Manufacturer/Brand:Louisvill
e Slugger

Manufacturer/Brand:Louisvill
e Slugger

Manufacturer/Brand:Wilson/A
TEC

Manufacturer/Brand:Champro

Manufacturer/Brand:BSN

Manufacturer/Brand:Crossove
r Symmetry

Manufacturer/Brand:BSN

Manufacturer/Brand:BSN

Manufacturer/Brand:BSN

Manufacturer/Brand:Champro

Manufacturer/Brand:Champro

Manufacturer/Brand:Glovers

Manufacturer/Brand:Glovers

Manufacturer/Brand:Champro

Manufacturer/Brand:Glovers

Manufacturer/Brand:Schutt

Manufacturer/Brand:BSN




Manufacturer/Brand:Pukka

Manufacturer/Brand:Pacific
Headwear

Manufacturer/Brand:NFHS

Manufacturer/Brand: ADAMS

Manufacturer/Brand:A4

Manufacturer/Brand:A4

Manufacturer/Brand:A4

Manufacturer/Brand:A4

Manufacturer/Brand:A4




Manufacturer/Brand:DEMARI
NI

Manufacturer/Brand:DEMARI
NI

Manufacturer/Brand:LOUISVI
LLE

Manufacturer/Brand:LOUISVI
LLE

Manufacturer/Brand:ATEC

Manufacturer/Brand:CHAMPR
@)

Manufacturer/Brand:PROMOU
ND

Manufacturer/Brand:CROSSO
VER

Manufacturer/Brand:RICHARD
SON ATHLETICS

Manufacturer/Brand:RICHARD
SON ATH

Manufacturer/Brand: TOMARK

Manufacturer/Brand:ATHLETI
C SPECIALTIES

Manufacturer/Brand: TOMARK

Manufacturer/Brand: TOMARK

Manufacturer/Brand: TOMARK

Manufacturer/Brand:ATHLETI
C SPECIALITES




Manufacturer/Brand:GLOVER
S

Manufacturer/Brand:SCHUTT

Manufacturer/Brand: ATHLET]I
C SPECIALTIES

Manufacturer/Brand:PUKKA

Manufacturer/Brand:PACIFIC
HEADWEAR

Manufacturer/Brand:NFHS

ALT SPEC BSN SOLD IN
DZNS

Manufacturer/Brand:BSN

NO BID Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID
NO BID Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID
NO BID Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID




NO BID Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID
NO BID Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID
NO BID Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID
NO BID Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID
NO BID Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID

As Spec Bsn/Louisville
slugger

Manufacturer/Brand:Louisvill
e slugger

As Spec BSN/Atec

Manufacturer/Brand:ATEC

ALT SPEC
BSN/MACGREGOR

Manufacturer/Brand:MACGRE
GOR

Alt Spec BSN/Promounds

Manufacturer/Brand:PROMOU
NDS

NO BID

Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID

ALT SPEC BSN

Manufacturer/Brand:BSN

ALT SPEC BSN-4' X 2'

Manufacturer/Brand:BSN

AS SPEC BSN/TOMARK

Manufacturer/Brand:BSN/TO
MARK




AS SPEC BSN/TOMARK

Manufacturer/Brand:BSN/TO
MARK

AS SPEC BSN/TOMARK

Manufacturer/Brand: TOMARK
/TANNER TEE

AS SPEC BSN/TOMARK

Manufacturer/Brand:BSN/TO
MARK

As Spec Bsn/Tomark

Manufacturer/Brand:Bsn/Tom
ark

Alt Spec BSN

Manufacturer/Brand:BSN

As Spec BSN/Tomark

Manufacturer/Brand:BSN/Tom
ark

As Spec Bsn/Schutt
w/chinstrap

Manufacturer/Brand:SCHUTT

Alt Spec Bsn/Alumagoal

Manufacturer/Brand:Bsn/Alu
magoal

NO BID

Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID

NO BID

Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID

As Spec BSN

Manufacturer/Brand:BSN




2nd 3rd

Supplier ltem Number:D1-Pro
NFHS

Supplier ltem Number:DBP

Supplier ltem Number:DOL-A

Supplier ltem Number:BKT B

Supplier Item Number:D1-PRO

Supplier Item Number:DBP

Supplier ltem Number:DOLA
Supplier ltem Number:30B
BUCKET

Supplier Item Number:1187366

Supplier Item Number:1385518

Supplier tem Number:1159028




Supplier tem Number:NO BID

Supplier ltem Number:D1 PRO

Supplier ltem Number:D1-PRO

Supplier ltem Number:DOL-A

Supplier ltem Number:BKTB

Supplier tem Number:D-1 PRO

Supplier ltem Number:DBP

Supplier ltem Number:DOL-A

Supplier ltem Number:BKT

Supplier Item Number:B5000

Supplier Item Number:B1000

Supplier ltem Number:8500

Supplier tem Number:B1000

Supplier ltem Number:K11389

Supplier ltem Number:MCBDYEL

Supplier Item Number:85000




Supplier Iltem Number:81000

Supplier ltem Number:TSK

Supplier Item Number:OSK

Supplier ltem Number:OSK11

Supplier Item Number:OSK

ltem Number/Model:N5338




ltem Number/Model:651AFML

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:651AFMO

Supplier ltem Number:CP28PS

Supplier ltem Number:LG22PS

Supplier Item Number:LG30WPRO

Supplier Item Number:CP30

Supplier Item Number:K12587




Supplier ltem Number:K12586

Supplier tem Number:CSUCPJ

Supplier ltem Number:BPVP2

Manufacturer Part
Number:GCMPTBC Supplier Item Number:GCMPTBC

Supplier Item Number:Cat 6

Manufacturer/Brand:Rawlings |ltem Number/Model:PRO150

[tem
Number/Model:PROCM43JBS

Manufacturer/Brand:Rawlings |ltem Number/Model:LSBASE

ltem Number/Model:LSBASE

ltem Number/Model:S90PA

Supplier ltem Number:CSUCPJ




Supplier Item Number:BPVP-OP4

Manufacturer Part
Number:GCM325B Supplier Item Number:GCM325B

Supplier Item Number:BBTRIO

Manufacturer/Brand:RAWLING
S ltem Number/Model:PRO15-0OP3

ltem Number/Model:#34 -
PROSCM44

Manufacturer/Brand:RAWLING
S ltem Number/Model:LS BASE

ltem Number/Model:LS BASE

ltem Number/Model:SA90PA

Supplier ltem Number:NO BID

Supplier ltem Number:NO BID

Manufacturer Part
Number:BBCMPROR/BBCMPR |Supplier Item Number:BBCMPROR-
OoX RIGHT/BBCMPROX-LEFT

Supplier tem Number:NO BID

Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID ltem Number/Model:NO BID




ltem Number/Model:1385193-
left/1385194-right

Manufacturer/Brand:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

Supplier ltem Number:598437

ltem Number/Model:632184

ltem Number/Model: 715061

ltem Number/Model:578534

ltem Number/Model:578534

ltem Number/Model:578535

ltem Number/Model:448635




ltem Number/Model:449822

Supplier ltem Number:621940

ltem Number/Model:632184

ltem Number/Model: 715061

ltem Number/Model:578534

[tem Number/Model:578535

ltem Number/Model:578535

ltem Number/Model:418635

ltem Number/Model: 728066
S/S compression Tight

ltem Number/Model:A168091




ltem Number/Model:A165339

ltem Number/Model:A168091

ltem Number/Model:BB15S1

ltem Number/Model:A165317

ltem Number/Model:A165309

ltem Number/Model:A165310

ltem Number/Model:A168024
GRIP

ltem Number/Model:16525249

ltem Number/Model:Z5

ltem Number/Model:BB15S1

ltem Number/Model:M7
ltem Number/Model:M7 CHEST
PROTECTOR

ltem Number/Model:A165309

ltem Number/Model:NO BID




ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:1385243

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

Iltem Number/Model:Power
Stick + Quick Stick

Iltem Number/Model:PWRBL-
100-04

Iltem Number/Model:WB01-000-
04

ltem Number/Model:80390

ltem Number/Model: TRAINING

[tem
Number/Model:POWERBALL

ltem Number/Model:BASEBALL
ltem Number/Model:BALANZ
BOARD

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:NO BID




ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:26

ltem Number/Model:N3230

ltem Number/Model:N3230

ltem Number/Model:N3221

ltem Number/Model:N3142

ltem Number/Model:N3165

ltem Number/Model:WTDX243

ltem Number/Model:WTDX243




ltem Number/Model:BBO5153

ltem Number/Model:BBO5153

ltem Number/Model:WTAT7375

Item Number/Model:B001X

ltem Number/Model:1237153

ltem Number/Model:CSTEAM

ltem Number/Model:1235951

ltem Number/Model:1091540

ltem Number/Model:1235890

ltem Number/Model:B007

ltem Number/Model:B080

ltem Number/Model:BB-101

ltem Number/Model:BB-103

ltem Number/Model:B008

ltem Number/Model:BB-101

ltem
Number/Model:325600SCCC

ltem Number/Model:BBDLM252




ltem Number/Model:SF3

ltem Number/Model:8D5

ltem Number/Model:BARB16

ltem Number/Model:#26

ltem Number/Model:N3230

ltem Number/Model:N3230

ltem Number/Model:N3221

ltem Number/Model:N3142

ltem Number/Model:N3165




ltem Number/Model:DXS243

[tem Number/Model:DX243

[tem Number/Model:OMAHA

[tem Number/Model:OMAHA

[tem Number/Model:WTAT7375

ltem Number/Model:BX001X

ltem Number/Model:#10001

ltem Number/Model:CSTP

ltem Number/Model: TTBB46

Iltem Number/Model:6X2

ltem Number/Model: TB- K13843

ltem Number/Model:DOT

ltem Number/Model: TB-K11059

ltem Number/Model:T-K12141

ltem Number/Model: TB12140

ltem Number/Model:BB-64




ltem Number/Model:BB101

ltem Number/Model:325650

ltem Number/Model:DLMN35

ltem Number/Model:SF3

ltem Number/Model:8D5D-A/C2

ltem Number/Model:BARB16

ltem Number/Model:1172577-
BK, 1172669-SCARLET

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:NO BID




ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:1391244

ltem Number/Model: TUFFTEE1

ltem Number/Model:BBBASEPR

ltem Number/Model:1237146

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:BBTMPL46

[tem Number/Model:1091540

ltem Number/Model:K13843




ltem Number/Model:K10395

ltem Number/Model:K11059

ltem Number/Model:K12141

ltem Number/Model:K12140

ltem Number/Model:BBRPLUGS

ltem Number/Model:K12965

ltem Number/Model:K11095

ltem Number/Model:BBDLM252

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:NO BID

ltem Number/Model:1015577




4th

5th







Manufacturer/Brand
:Jerzees

Item
Number/Model:29
M

Manufacturer/Brand
‘RUSSELL

Item
Number/Model:640
30MK




Manufacturer/Brand
:NO BID

Item
Number/Model:NO
BID

Manufacturer/Brand
‘RUSSELL

Item
Number/Model:640
30MK











































