BID TABULATION
GARLAND INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

RFO #420-22 Sale of Surplus iPads

Imaan

Bluum Diamond Motor City | Powerhouse | Pulse Supply Total Vantage
Vendors Troxell Assets GDI Trading | Global Asset dde I eI Computer | Recycling Inc | Chain Solutions [N Jell RJH Supply | Technology Point
Lot # Description Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount Bid Amount
Apple iPad Pro 9.7" (Wi-Fi Only) 128
1|GB Space Gray - (1000 per lot) $42,500.00 | $110,000.00 $0.00 $90,000.00 | $118,000.00 | $116,000.00 | $93,750.00 | $100,000.00 $85,000.00 $8,000.00 | $113,700.00 | $107,720.00
Apple iPad Pro 9.7" (Wi-Fi Only) 128
2|GB Space Gray - (1000 per lot) No bid $110,000.00 $0.00 $90,000.00 | $118,000.00 | $116,000.00 $93,750.00 | $100,000.00 $85,000.00 $8,000.00 | $113,700.00 | $107,720.00
Apple iPad Pro 9.7" (Wi-Fi Only) 128
3|GB Space Gray - (1000 per lot) No bid $110,000.00 $0.00 $90,000.00 | $118,000.00 | $116,000.00 $93,750.00 | $100,000.00 $85,000.00 $8,000.00 | $113,700.00 | $107,720.00
Apple iPad Pro 9.7" (Wi-Fi Only) 128
4|GB Space Gray - (1000 per lot) No bid $110,000.00 $0.00 $90,000.00 | $118,000.00 | $116,000.00 $93,750.00 | $100,000.00 $85,000.00 $8,000.00 | $113,700.00 | $107,720.00
Apple iPad Pro 9.7" (Wi-Fi Only) 128
5|GB Space Gray - (1000 per lot) No bid $110,000.00 $0.00 $90,000.00 | $118,000.00 | $116,000.00 $93,750.00 | $100,000.00 $85,000.00 $8,000.00 | $113,700.00 | $107,720.00
Apple iPad Pro 9.7" (Wi-Fi Only) 128
6|GB Space Gray - (1000 per lot) No bid $110,000.00 $0.00 $90,000.00 [EEIPIR] $116,000.00 $93,750.00 | $100,000.00 $85,000.00 $121,780.02 | $8,000.00 | $113,700.00 | $107,720.00
Apple iPad Pro 9.7" (Wi-Fi Only) 128
7|GB Space Gray - (1000 per lot) No bid $110,000.00 $0.00 $90,000.00 [SPIHel] $116,000.00 $93,750.00 | $100,000.00 $85,000.00 $121,780.02 | $8,000.00 | $113,700.00 | $107,720.00
Apple iPad Pro 9.7" (Wi-Fi Only) 128
8|GB Space Gray - (1000 per lot) No bid $110,000.00 [ $110,000.00| $90,000.00 [EFPINLKN] $116,000.00 $93,750.00 | $100,000.00 $85,000.00 $121,780.02 | $8,000.00 | $113,700.00 | $107,720.00
Apple iPad Pro 9.7" (Wi-Fi Only) 128
9|GB Space Gray - (1000 per lot) No bid $110,000.00 | $110,000.00| $90,000.00 [ESFEIFNNEG] $116,000.00 | $93,750.00 | $100,000.00 $85,000.00 $121,780.02 | $8,000.00 | $113,700.00 | $107,720.00
Total Bid Amount $42,500.00 | $990,000.00 | $220,000.00 | $810,000.00 $1,044,000.00 | $843,750.00 | $900,000.00 $765,000.00 | $1,096,020.18| $72,000.00 [$1,023,300.00| $969,480.00

Award Amount

$514,000.00

$608,900.10

The District solicited 44 vendors and received 13 responses.




